
Chicago Wheat Margin Watch: June

Chicago wheat futures ended the first half of June largely unchanged as an abundance of global winter wheat supplies has provided
resistance to any attempt for a rally. USDA indicated 53 percent of the spring crop was rated good/excellent through the week ending June 8.
This was up from the previous week but 8 points below the 5-year average. Fifty-four percent of the winter wheat crop was rated
good/excellent, up 2 points from the previous week. Harvest is underway, with 4 percent complete compared to the 5-year average of 7
percent. The Kansas wheat harvest will begin in the next week, some 7-10 days later than normal due to slow maturation. USDA on June 12
released its monthly WASDE report. For wheat, the domestic 2025/26 balance sheet called for larger supplies, unchanged domestic use,
higher exports, and lower ending stocks. Supplies were raised minimally on higher output. Exports were raised by 25 million bushels to 825
million on strong early season sales, especially for Hard Red Winter wheat. Ending stocks were lowered by 25 million bushels to 898 million.
This would be 7 percent higher than a year ago and below the average pre-report estimate of 916 million bushels (868 to 948 million range).
The global wheat outlook called for reduced supplies, higher trade, and lower ending stocks. Lower beginning stocks in Russia more than
offset higher production for the EU and India. Projected ending stocks were lowered by 3.0 million tons to 262.8 million, slightly lower than the
average pre-report estimate of 265.1 million metric tons. Most of this reduction took place in Russia, Iraq, and Turkey. USDA will release its
quarterly Grain Stocks report at the end of the month, providing insight into indicated disappearance levels over the past 3 months. Our clients
continue monitoring opportunities to extend new-crop coverage with flexible strategies that will allow for potential margin improvement over
time.

Jul 2025 Chicago Wheat      HIGH ($3.80)   LOW ($5.20)   LAST ($4.91)   10YR PERCENTILE 46.0% 

The estimated yield for the Jul 2025 crop is 81 bushels per acre and the non-land operating cost is $523 per acre. Land cost for

Jul 2025 is estimated at $275 per acre 1. Basis for the Jul 2025 crop is estimated at $-0.5 per bushel.

Jul 2026 Chicago Wheat      HIGH ($3.11)   LOW ($3.89)   LAST ($3.62)   10YR PERCENTILE 64.1% 

The estimated yield for the Jul 2026 crop is 84 bushels per acre and the estimated operating cost is $484 per acre. Land cost for
Jul 2026 is estimated at $300 per acre 1. Basis for the Jul 2026 crop is estimated at $-0.45 per bushel.

1 The Chicago Wheat Margin Watch yield, land and non-land operating cost values are based upon central Illinois low productivity farmland
crop estimates in the "Historic Corn, Soybean, Wheat, and Double-crop Soybeans" report published by the Department of Agricultural and
Consumer Economics at the University of Illinois.

The information contained in this publication is taken from sources believed to be reliable, but is not guaranteed by Commodity & Ingredient
Hedging, LLC, nor any affiliates, as to accuracy or completeness, and is intended for purposes of information and education only. Nothing
therein should be considered as a solicitation to trade commodities or a trade recommendation by Commodity & Ingredient Hedging, LLC. All
references to market conditions are current as of the date of the presentation. Futures and options trading involves the risk of loss. Past
performance is not indicative of future results. Please visit www.cihedging.com to subscribe to the CIH Margin Watch report.

Commodity & Ingredient Hedging, LLC
120 South La Salle St, Suite 2200 Chicago, IL 60603 1.866.299.9333

07/2408/2409/2410/2411/2412/2401/2502/2503/2504/2505/2506/25

-4
-2

0

M
ar

gi
n 

/ b
u

JUNE
-6

-4

-2

0

07/2408/2409/2410/2411/2412/2401/2502/2503/2504/2505/2506/25

-3
-2
-1
0

M
ar

gi
n 

/ b
u

JUNE
-4

-2

0

http://www.farmdoc.uiuc.edu/manage/actual_projected_costs.pdf
https://www.cihedging.com/

